ORDINANCE NO. 22-12

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF HICKORY HILLS
ADOPTING THE 202] INTERNATIONAL BUILDING
THE 2021 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE, THE
ILLINOIS PLUMBING CODE, THE 2023 INTERNATIONAL
FIRE CODE, CHICAGO ELECTRICAL CODE, AND THE
ILLINOIS ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE

MICHAEL HOWLEY
Mayor

DEBORAH FERRERO
BRIAN FONTE
HENRY KMAN

MICHAEL 5. McHUGH

PATRICK M. PURTILL

JOSEPH M. STACHNIE. I
BRIAN WAIGHT
SCOTT ZIMMERMAN
Aldermen

PLORAH CATIZONE
City Clerk

ALANT. VODICKA
Treasurer

Prepared by
LOUIS F. CAINKAR, LTD.
City Attomey



BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of Hickory Hills, Cook County,
follows:

ORDINANCE NO. 22-12

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF HICKORY HILLS
ADOFTING THE 2021 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING
CODE, THE 2021 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE,
THE 2021 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE, THE
ILLINOIS PLUMBING COD . THE 2021 INTERNATIONAL
FIRE CODE, CHICAGO ELECTRICAL CODE, AND THE
ILLINOIS ENERGY CONSERVATION CODFE

Section 1

Mlinois, as

That Chapter 24, Building Code, of the Hickory Hills Municipal Code, be amended
by changing Section 24.01(a), Building Code, 10 read as follows:

24.01

BUILDING CODES

iz “The 2021 Internationa) Building Code™ a published by the International Code
Council, Ine. is hereby adopled as the Building Code of the City with the following changes,
additions or insertions:

Section 101.1, insert “City of Hickory Hills "

Section 101.4.3, change the words “International Plumbing Code™ to “Illingis
Plumbing Code™, Change the last sentence 1o read “Private sewage dispesal
systems are prohibited”. Add the following  sentence: “Whenever the

International Plumbing Code is referenced, the reference shall be to the Minais
Plambing Code™.

Section 102.4.], change to read “In the event of conflict between this code and
any referenced code or other ordinance of the City, the mose stringent provisions
shall be applied onless the building official otherwise determines ™

Section 103.1, delete in fudl.

Sectien 1032, change first sentence to read “The building official shall be the
Building Commissioner ™

Section 105.2, delete paragraph 1.2, 4. and 6 under Building_

Section 109.4, add the following to read “A penalty of not less than 5100 nor
more than 5750 iz hereby imposed for each violation, Each day that a vielation
occurs shall be considered 5 Sepirate violation ang subject (o Penalty ”

Section 113.1, delete the last two sentences and add “The board of appeals shall
be the City Council.~



Section 113.2, change the last sentence to read “The board shall have the
authority to waive the requirements of this Code for due cause in hardship
situations, which decision to waive shall not be subject 1o further appeal.™

Section 114.4, add the following, “A penalty of not less than F100 nor more
than $750 is hereby imposed for each violation of this Code, Each day that »
violation occurs shall be considered 3 separate violation and subject to penalty.”
Section 903.2, add the following: “Automatic sprinkler systems are required to
be installed m residential structures only as provided in Section 24-15 of the
Hickory Hills Municipal Code.”

Section 1209.1, add the following, “The minimom height for a crawl space shall

be 3 feet All erawl spaces shall have a minimum 2 inch concrete cement floor
with vapor barrier.”

Section 1807.1, add the following, “All foundations and foundation walls shal]
be concrete foundations and no other materials may be used

Section 1807.1.3. debete in fll,

Section 1807.1.4, delete in full.

Section  1807,1.5, add the following, “Masonry foundation walls are noe
permitted.”

Section 1809.9, delete in fig)],

Section 180912, delete in figll,

The followmg Appendizes are herehy declared to be mandatory: Appendix I
Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix H, Appendix J, hppﬁndit:g S }

Appendix D, Fire Districts. Section D101.1, chanpe firet - :
fire: district shal] inchade af] territory within me-’:n:i' T

« 15 chap adding
minmread The Chicagg Electrical Code 1 appiy nithg'jl?jﬂgcy City am:
mamtmn;:"f £ code and povem all electrical installation  ang




Section 2
That Chapter 24, Building Code, of the Hickory Hills Municipal Code, be amended
by changing Section 24.01(h), Building Code, 10 read as follows:

24.01 BUILDING CODES

: : S = ; sonal
) The "2021 International Residential Code,” ag published by the Internationa

Code Cnufulicu, Inc. is hereby adopted as the International Residential Cudn {Tor Ome- and Two-
Family Dwellings) of the City with the tollowing changes, additions or insertions-

Section R101.1, mseri “City of Hickory Hills.”

Section R102.4.1, change 1o read “In the event of conflict between this ma:b:m;i

any referenced code or other ordinance of the City, the most stringent provisions

shall be applied unless the building official otherwize determines ™

Soction RI03.1, delete in fall.

Section R103.2, change first sentence to read “The building official shall be fhe
Building Commissioner”,

Section F105.2, delepe Paragraph 1,2, 3, 5, 9, and 10 under Building.
Section R108.6, add the following to read “The sdditional fee for commencing
work without obtaining the MeCessary permits shall be $50 Per day measured

from ﬁmﬁmeﬁm“wklx:gm until the required permifs are oblained. This foe
shall be paid a1 the time that the PETINILS are jssped ™

Section BT 12.3, delete in figll.

Section R 12.4, delete in figll.

'Fz_lhlr. R30L2(1), insert “The building officia) shall

. determine the applicahle
triteria from the referenced tahjes and fipres ™

Section R4012, insert <Al foundations and foundation wa
ronerets and no other materials may be used ™

Section R402.1, delete in ful, nchuding Section R402.1.1 ang Section 40212
Section R402.3, delete in ful, wecluding Section Ragz 3 1
Section R402.4, delete in fil




Section R403.1, change the firs seatence o read “All footings shall be poared
concrete footings and no other materials may be used ™

Section R404.1, change the fast sentence o read “All foundation walls and
retaining walls shall be poured concrete and no other materials may be used.”

Section R404.1.1, debete the last SEnlencs as masonry foundation wills ape
prohibited,

section R404.1.2, delete in Tuil, inchiding Section RaQs1.2.1.

Section R404.1.4,1, delete in fill,

Section R404.1.5.1, delete in fiall.

Section R404.1.5.3, delete in full.

Section R4gd ] B, delete in full,

Section R404.2, delete in full.

Section R404.5, delete in full.

Section R408.1, add the following, “The munimim height for 4 craw] space shall

be 3 feet. All crawl spaces shall have a minimum 2 inch comirele cement flogr
with vapor birrier ™

Section P‘Eﬁﬂl-h change paragraph o read "Only methods, materials,
construction and systems allowed by the Niinois Plumbing Code, as modified
herein, are permitied ™




The following Appendixes arc hereby declared to be mandatory: Appendic AA
Appendix AB, Appendix AC, Appeadix AL, Appendix AF, Appendix AG.
Appendix AH, Appendix AJ, Appendix AK, Appendix AM. Appendix AN,
Appendix AP, and Appendix AT,

Section 3

That Chapter 24, Building Code, of the Hickory Hills Mimicipal Code, be amended
by changing Section 2428, Mechanical Code. 1o read as follows:

24.28 MECHANICAL CODE

The “2021 Imemnational Mechanjcal Code" a5 published by the International Code
Coanecil, Ine, is hereby adopted as the Mechanical Code of the City with the following changes,
wdditions or insertions:

Section 101.1, insert "City of Hickory Hills,"

Section 103.1, delete in fnll.

Section 1032, change first sentence w0 read "The code officia] shall be the
Building Commissioner. "

each violation. Each day that a violation occurs shall be considersd t
vielation and subject L penafly ™ P

Sm:ljn_:m 1092, change 1o read "The code official sha] establish 3 schedule of
Permit fees and plan review fees.”

1_;: . 0 109.6, change to read “The code official muy authorize a refund of
g




That Chapter 29, Fire Prevention,

Section 4

by changing Section 29.01, Fire Prevention Code, to read as follows:

2001

heseby adopted as the Fire Prevention

FIRE PREVENTION CODFE.

“2021 International Fire Code™ as published by the International Code Council, Inc. is
Code of the City with the following changes, additions or

insertiomns:

Section 1011, insert "City of Hickory Hills,™
Section 103.2, change 1o read "The code official is the Fire Inspector.”

Section 107.2, add the following, “The code official shall establish a schedule of
permit fees which are required to be paid in conjunction with the issnance of
any required permit.”

Section 111, delete in full Al appeals shall be taken as provided in the
Building Code,

Section 903.2, add the following afier the firse senzence: “Automatic sprinkler
Systems are required 1o be | bed 0 residential structures only as provided in
Section 24-15 of the Hickory Hills Municipal Code "

Section 110353, insen “Jznuary 1, 2020."

Section 5704.2.96.1, add the following, “The code official shall establish the
limits in which the storage of Class [ ang Class 1T liguids and above-ground
tanks ootside of buildings is prohibited »

E‘_.u;r.iur_t 6244, add the following, “The code official shall establish the
limits in which the storage of Class 1 and Class | liquids amd above-gronnd
tanks is prohibited.”

Saqr.im 38062, add the following, “The code official shall establish the fmits in
which the storage of flammakle tryogenic flnids in stationary containers js
prohibited.™”

Section 6104.2, add the following, “The code official shall establish the limits in

which the storape of liquefied petrolenm BA5 s restricted for the profection of
heavily populateg or congested aregs ™

Appendix B, Fire-Flgw Reguirements, for Buildings, i hereby adopted.
Appendix C, Fire Hydrant Locations ang Distribution, js hereby adopted.
Appendix D, Fire Apparstus Access Roads, iz hereby adopted.

of the Hickory Hills Municipal Code, be amended



Appendix E, Hazard Calegories, is hereby adopled,
Appendix F, Hazard Ranking, is hereby adopted,

Appendix G, Cryogenic Fluds—-Weight and Volume Equivalents, is herchy
adopted.

Appendix H, Hazardous Materials Management Plun (HMMP) and Hazardous
Materials Inventory Statement {HMIS} Instructions, is hereby adopied.

Appendix I, Fire Protection Systems — MNoncompliant Conditions, is herchy
adopted,

Appendix. K, Construgting Bequirements for Existing Ambulatory Care
Facilities, is hereby adopted.

provisions of the Life Safety Code, as published by the National Fire Protection Association shall
Eovern unless waived by the code official for due cause in hardship siiuations.
Section 5
That Chapter 26, Plumbing Code, of the Hickory Hills Municipal Code, be amended
by changing Section 26,01, Plumbing Code, to read as follows;
26.01 PLUMBING CODE
at 77 Mineis Administrative Code, Part $90 with amendments to July 1, 2022, is hereby adopted as
the Plumbing Code of the Cily with the following changes, additions or insertions:

Appendix A, Table A All materials shall meet the lollowing requirements or ke
approved by the Building Commissioner,

Approved Materials for Water Service Pipe shall be as permitted by Tahle
29 (18-29-605.4) of the Chicago Plembing Code.

Approved Materials for Water Distribution Pipe shall be as permitted by
Tahle 20 (18-29-605.5) of the Chicago Flumbing Code.

Approved Standards for Firtings shall be as permitted by Table 29 (18.29-
605.6) of the Chicago Plumbing Code.




Section 6

That Chapter 25, Electrical Code, of the Hickory Hills Municipal Code, be amended
by changing Section 25.01, Electrical Code, to read as follows:
250 ELECTRICAL CODE

The “Chicago Electrical Code™ (Title 14E of the Municipal Code of Chicage as amended
to July 1, 2022) is hereby adopted as the Electrical Code of the City with the following changes,
“City of Hickory Hills" shall be substituted for “City of Chicago.”
Any amendments to the Chicago Electrical Code after July 1, 2022 shall be effective in the City
upan the date of applicability in the City of Chicago,
Section 7

That Chapter 24, Building Code, of the Hickory Hills Municipal Code, be amended
by changing Section 2430, Energy Conservation Code, to read as follows:

24.30 ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE

The “llinois Enenzy Conservation Code™ as published by the Capital Development Boarg
of the State of Nlinois (Section 600,110 of Title 71 of the llineis Administrative Codde) is hereby
adopted as the Energy Conservation Code of the Ci

Section 8

Unless otherwise provided, the penalty clause for this ordinance shall be Section 1-9
ol the Hickory Hills Municipal Code.

If any section. paragraph, elause or provision of this ordinance shall be held invalid,
the invalidity thereof shall not affect any of the other provisions of this ordinance.






