CHAFTER 24

EBUILDING CODE

24.01 EUILDING CODES

{a)  “The 2015 Intemational Building Code” as published by the International Code Council,
Inc., 1s hereby adopled as the Building Code of the City with the following changes, additions or insertions:

Section 101.1, insert “City of Hickary Hills®.

Section 101.4.3, change the words “Infernational Plumbing Code” 1o
“lina: Plumbing Code”.  Change the last sentence to read “Private
sewage disposal systems are prohibited”.  Add the following senfence:
“Whenewver the Intermational Plumbing Code is referenced, the reference
shall be 1o the lllinois Plumbing Code”.

Section 102.4, change the last sentence to read “In the event of conflict
between this code and any referenced code or other ardinance of the
City, the most siringent provisions shall be applied unless the building
official otherwize determines”,

Section 103,1, delete in full.

Section 1032, change first sentence fo read “The building official shall
b the Bulldirgg Commissionsr”,

Section 1052, delete paragraph 1, 2, 4, and 6 under Building.

Section 1084, add the following o read “The additional fee for
commencing work withoul oblamming the necessary permits shall be 50
per day measured from the lime that work began until the required
permits are obtained. This fee shall be paid at the fime that the permits
are iszuad”,

Section 113.7, delete the last twe sentences and add “The board of
appeals shall be the City Councl”,

Section 113.2, change the last senlence 1o read “The board shall have
the authorly fo waive the reguirements of this Code for due causes in
hardship situations, which decision lo waive shall not be subject to
further appeal”.

Section 114.4, add the following, “A penatty of not less than $100 nor
more than 5730 i hereby imposed for each violation of this Code”,

Section 9032, add the following: “Automatic sprinkler systems are
required to be mstalied in residential structures only as provided in
Zection 24-15 of the Hickory Hills Municipal Code,”

Section 1209.1, add the following, “The minimum heght! for a8 crawl
space shall be 3 feel. Al crawl spaces shall have a minimum 2 inch
concrefe cement floor with vapor barmer.”

Section 12093, add the following, “Where a fumace s located in an
attic, the furnace shall be located mn an enclosed mzulation room of nof
lezs than B4 sguare fool of fat ares with & walkway of a minimum 24
inches wide to the furnace from the access opening.”

24 -1 Fobruary 2018 Supplement



Section 1612.3, change the second sentence to read The flood hazard
map shall be the most recent flood inzurance rate map issued by the
Federal Emergency Management Agency, ag amended from tme to
firmie",

Section 1807.1, add the following, "All foundations and foundation walls
shall be concrete foundations and no othar materialks may be used.”

Section 1807.1.5, delete in full,
Section 1807 .14, delste in full.

Section 1807.1.5, add the lollowing, “Masonry toundation walls are nof
permitted.”

Seclion 1809.9, delete n full,

Section 180912, delefe in full.

Section 34122, insert “January 1, 19507,

The following Appendixes are hereby declared fo be mandatony:

Appendix D, Appendi F, Appendix G, Appendix |, Appendix J, Appendix
K

Appendix D, Fire Districts, Section 0101.1, change first sentence to read
“The fire: district shall include all territory within the City™.

Appendix F, Rodentproofing, Secbon F101.6, delete in full.

Appendix H. Signs, is hereby adopted, but nothing therein shall permit
the erection or maintenance of any sign unless permitled by the zoning
crdinance.

Appendix K, Administrative Provisions, Section K101.1, is changed by
adding a sentence o read “The Chicago Electncal Code shall apply
within the City and shall be the elecirical code and govern all electrical
installation and mainbenances”,

(b} The “2015 International Residential Code”, as published by the International Code
Council, Inc. 1= hereby adepted as the Inlernational Residential Code {for One- and Two-Family

Dhweellings) of the City with the following changes, additions or insertions:

Section R101.1, insert “City of Hickory Hills™,

Saction R102.4, change the last senfence to read “In the event of conflict
babween this code and any referenced code of other ordinance of the
City, the most stringent provisions shall be applied unless the Buileing
official otheresse defermines”.

Saction R103.1, delote in full.

Saction R103.2, change first sentence to read *The bulldineg official shall
be the Building Commissoner”.

Section R105.2, delete paragraph 1, 2, 3, and 5 under Building.

Fa.2 February 2018 Supplernent



Section R108.6, add the following o read “The additonal fee faor
Commencing work without obtaining fhe NECessary pemils shall be 550
per day measured from the time that waork began until the reguired
permits are obtained. This fee shall be paid at the fime that the permils
are isswed,”

Secfion R112, delebs in full, Al appeals shall be taken as provided in the
Building Code,

Section R113.4, add the following, “A penalty of not less than $100 nor
more than 3750 is hereby imposed for each viclation of this Code "

Tabla R301.2, Insert, “The building official shall determine the apphcable
criteria from the referenced fables and figuras,”

Section R401.2, insert "All foundations and foundation walls shall be
poured concrete and no other materials may e used,”

Section R404.1.2, delete in full,
Saction R402 1, delete in ful,
Section R402.3, delete in full,

Zection R403.1, add the following, "All foofings shall be paured concrete
footings and no olher materials iy b used,”

Secton R404.1, add the following, “All foundation walls and retaining
walls shall be poured concrete and no other malerials may be used.”

Soction R404.1.1, delete in full,
Saction R404.1.8, delets in full,

Section R404.2, delete in full,
Section R404.5, delete in full,

Section R408.4, add the following, *The minimum height for a crawl
space: shall be 3 foet. Al crawl spaces shall have a minimum 2 inch
concrete cement floor with vapor barrier.”

section RED7.1, add the following, "Where a furnace is located in an
altic, the furmace shall be located in an enclosed insulation room of not
less than 64 square feel of flat area with a walkway of a minimum 24
inches wide to the furnace from the access GpEning.”

Section P2603 6.1, delete in full as private sewane disposal syslems are
nit permitied,

Section P2004.1, add the following: “Automatic sprinkler systems are
required 1o be installed in residential structures only as provided in
Section 24-15 of the Hickory Hills Mu nizipal Code "

Part VI - Plumbing. Only methods, materials, construction and systems
allowed by the llincis Plumbing Code are permitied,

Part VIll - Electrical. Only wiring methods, materials, construction and
systems allowed under the Chicago Electrical Code are permitied.

24-3 February 2018 Supplement




e,

The following Appendixes are hereby declared o be mandalory;
Appendix A, Appendix B, Appendix C, Appendix D, Appendx G,

Appendix H, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix M, Appendiy N and
Appendix P,

24.02 BUILDING PERMIT FEES

The fees to be charged for building permits for erecting, altenng, repairing, or adding to
buildings or structures shall be as follows:

{a)  The lees for building permits shall be as follaws:

1. for single-familty and multi-family residential structures the fee shall be 520 per
51,000 of "construction cost” with a minimum of S250;

2. lor all other structures the fee shall be $30 per 31,000 of “construction cost™ with a
minimurm of $500; and

3. the building permit fee does not include nspechion fees, plan examination fee,
engneering fee, occupancy permit fee and waler/sewer connection fees,

(bl The fee to renew a building permit which has expired for failure 1o complele construction
within 1 year or the failure to commence construction within & months shall be an addiional fee of 5
percent of the criginal building permit fee for each manth construction continues after the above periods.

() For remodeling or additions, the plan examination fee shall be 3150 for an existing single-
family residential strecture and $300 for all other eXisting structures. For new construction, the plan
examination fee shall be $250 for single-family residential structures and $500 for all other structures

id)  The buikding permil fee for detached garages shall be 5300 which includes all costs for
inspeclion and occupancy.

(2} The permif fiee for 2 new driveway or extension of exisling driveway shall be $60.
{fy  The permit fee for a utility or storage shed shall be $25.

{g)  The permit fee for demolition of a primary structure shall be $300 and the permit foo for
the demaolifion of an accessory structure shall be $100.

() The permit fee for a fence shall be 25,

{iy  The permit fee for a removal and replacement of curb and gutter adjacent o any
drivessay shall be 540,

The lerm “construction cost” means the reasonable value of all services, labor, materials, and use of
scaltolding and other devices entering inta and necessary 1o the proseculion and completion of the work
ready for occupancy. The construction cost i provided by the permittee subject to final approval of the
Building Commissioner. The construction cost does not include City permit and other fees. The Building
Commissioner may use consfruction cast data from RSMeans to determing “construction cost”. Erior bo
the issuance of a cerlificate of OCCUPANCY of oCcupantcy permit, the Building Commissioner may ragquire
thal the permittes submil a sworn contractor's statement showing the actual cost of construction which
shall be used to determine the construction cost.

24.03 ADDITIOMAL FEES

{a} Mo porson shall dig, excavale for or instali any water line or sewer line on the dedicated
public ight-of-way. All such work shall be done by the City plumber at rates authorized by thie City.

24 -4 February 2018 Supplement




e,

{b]  The fees to be charged for a permit to tap or otherwise make a connection to any waler
line shall be established by the Building Commissioner and set forth on a schedule. Fees shall inchude a
charge for a water meter, which water meter shall remain the property of the City. In addition, a fee shall
be charged for making the actual tap, including digging, basckfilling, corporation stop, roundway, B box
installed, and cutting and repairing of street and right-of-way. Said fee shall be based upon the siza of
conneclion and the distance of installation. Fees for auguring shall be extra and stated SEparatehy,

{ch  The fees to be charged for a permit Lo tap or otherwise make a connectian 1o Ay Sewer
line shall be established by the Building Commissioner and set forth on a schedule. Fees shall include a
charge for making the actual tap, cut in tee or coring hole, digging, backfiling, and cutting and repairing of
street and right-of-way,

24.04 BUILDING INSPECTION FEES

A building inzpection fee of $50 iz establishad for each bulding inspection.
24.05 BOND REQUIRED

(a) Generally, The following bonds shall be deposited, in cash, with the city before a
buikding permit or plumbing permit is issued which requires said bonds, The bond inspechon fee s for
mspection of the site and is not refundable. The cash bonds shafl be refunded afier the operating
departmeants have inspected the site and have cerified that all requiremnents of this chapter have been
complied with by the permittes, except in the case of restoration or repair of streets or other public

the requirements of this chapter. If the permittes refuses or is unable 1o complale the work, the city shall
send written nolice to the permittee at his adiress listed on the permit that waork remains to be done, If the
work = not salisfactorily completed within 30 days after nolice, the city shall cause the work to be
completed, payment for said work 1o be deducted from the cash bonds and any remainder refunded to
the: permiltes, In cases invalving the repair or restoration of the street or public proparty tooils condifion
pricr to the opening, the city shall do all the work, and the cost thereof, together with the sum af 25
percent lor overhead, shall be deducted from the cash bond on deposit and the balance retumied to the
deposilar. In the case of public ulilities, the city shall do all the work and the public ulilities biled on the
same basis for the work done. If the bonds are not sufficient to cover the payment, the full amaount of the
bonds shall be used or be forfelled and the permittee shall be biled for the difference. All bonds shall
remain on deposil for & minimum period of two years, excepl bonds issued under subsection (B){1) and
(2) below, which bonds shall be refundable within 30 days afler the cerificate af n:cup@:u:y is EEgued.

(b)  Single-Family Buildings. For new construction, the: general contractor shall deposit a
3,000 cash bond for each single family residence being constructed, which bond shall cover the
drainlayer and plumbing contractor, ot grading, landscaping, required free in parkway, restoration of
parkway, and repair of street, curb, gutter and sidewslk. The Building Commissioner MAY Wave or
reduce the amoun! of the cash bond where the public improvements (sanitary sower, water, storm SEWET

and streets) are being installed by the developer of a subdivision where a lelter of credit has been
prowided,

(c)  Multi-Family Buildings. For new construction, the general confractor shall deposit 5
cash bond in the sum of 55000 for each mulb-family building. The bond covers the drainiayer and
plumbing contractor,

{d} Commercial and Industrial Euildings. For new construction or for m.dhsfant}nl
remodeling, the general confractor shall deposit a cash bond in the sum of $5.000 for aach commerncial
and mndustrial buikding. The bond covers the drainlayer and plumbing contractor.

(2)  Applicability. The above bonds as required in subsections {a) through {d) shall only

apply in cases of new construction, In all other cases the required surety bond must be in effect for each
confractor as set forth in this code

24.-5 February 2018 Supplement




(fy ~ Temporary Occupancy Permit. In cases where weather prohibits the complelion of
certzin work o be performed on the pubdic right-of-way for public improvements, or other im provements
oulside of Lhe struclurs on private property, the Building Commissioner may issue a temporary QGCUpancy
permit providing that everything except the above is completed. A cash bond in the amount of 125
percent of the cost of the improvements as determined by the city shall be posted.

{a) Forfeiture of Bond. In the evenl that there s noncompliance with the terms of
conditions of a cash bond, the cash Bond shall be forfeiled to the City i such noncomplianee shall
tonfinue for a period of 6 months after written notice is provided detailed the noncomplance. Any cash
bond which has not been refunded within 3 vears after deposit shall be fodeited o the City except in

tases where the Building Commissioner extends such date because of the prexpected delays in
construction.

2406  TIME LIMITATIONS FOR BUILDING PERMITS

(2}  Construction of any building for which a building permit has been issued must be started
within & months of the date of the isstance of the permit,

{b)  Construction of any building for which a building permit has been ssued must be
completed within fwo years of the date of the issuance of the permil.

() If the holder of any building permit fails to comply with lthe provisions of this sachon, the
permit shall be null and vaid,

(d)  The Building Commissioner shall send nofice in writing lo the holder of any such building
permit at feast 30 days prior 1o the expiration of such permit of the impending expiration.

2407  FENCES

(@) I shall be unlawiul for any person fo build, construct or erect any fence within the city
without @ fence construction permit from the Building Commissioner. The application for a fence
construction permit shall be accompanied by a sketch showing the proposed lecation of lhe fence in
relation fo lot ines, and exisling permansnt impravements, the type of construction, the material 1o be
used, and the proposed height of the fence.

(B} A fence is defined as 5 man-made struciure forming @ barrier which = not a part of any
Duiiding or structure, and is more than two feet in height cver existing grade.

ic]  Every fence shall be designed and construcled to resist a horizontal windd pressure of ot
less than twice that required for buildings as set forth in the Euilding Code.

(d}  Residential Requirements. The maximum fence height in a residential use destrict shall
not exceed 6 feet between buildings, and shall nol exceed & feel in height in the rear yard behing the
building, and shall not exceed 3 feet in the front yard setback. All height dimensions shall be measured
from the established grade to the topmost section of the fence. A gate or opening shall be provided in all
fence enclosures,  Any suitable construction malsrial may be used for a fence except: chicken wire,
square welded mesh wire, barbed wire, electrically charged wire, lem porary snow fence, or solid concrete
block, or be topped with sharp-edged material except that this shall nat be construed to prohibit picket
fences. All fences in the front-yard sethack shall be of chain-iink or other “clear vision™ material.  The
entire kength of the fence shall be constructed of the same of harmonious material.

(e} Al fences shall be constructad so that the posts are not located on the cutside therzaf in
relation to the property on which the fance being constriscted.

24-5 February 2018 Supplement




P i

24,08 SMOKE DETECTORS

{8l Smoke defectors on new consfruction of residentsal units or all units having miked

OCcupancy with residential unite in the City of Hickory Hills shali be equipped with approved smoke
detectors in the manner described in this section,

k) At least one approved smoke defector shall be installed on each living level in every
single family residential unit and in each unit of multi-family dwelling units including the residential units
contained in buildings of mixed accupancy with commercial zaning clazsificaions or other Zoning
classilications. The smoke detectors shall be mstalled on the ceiling and at least 6 inches from any wall

localed 6 to 12 inches from the ceiling and within 15 feet of &l rooms used for sheeping purposes,

e} Al mulfi-dwalling buildings and buildings of mixed oocupancy having any residential units
shall contain not less than one approved smoke delector at the uppermost ceiling of all interior stairwells.
All approved smoke detectors herein required shall be installed on the cedling at least 6 inches from the
wall ar a wall located 6 lo 12 inches fram ceilings.

{dl  Smoke deteciors shall be approved by Undernwriters Laboralory Inc. Al approved smoke
detectors shall be permanently wired to the electnic service of each dwelling.

(&} Inall instances where a building permit is required and issued for remodeding of any main
structure which containg a residential unit and the cosl of the remodeling shall exceed $500, then the
provisions of this section shall be applicable, excepl that the smoke detector may be of a battery type,
and such structure shall be required fo be equipped with a smoke detector as pravided for in this section.

(f)  The provisions of this section shall akso be applicable to buildings which contain an
automatic sprinkling system throughowut.

24,09 EXTERIOR WALLS, INDUSTRIAL AREAS

All new construction in the -1 industrial Zoning Classificafion in the City of Hickory Hills shall
have al least 70 percent of the exteriar wakls constructed of solid masonry or of brick veneer with at least
one course of face brick as approved by the Building Department.

24.10 EXCAVATIONS, GRADING, DUMPING, AND FILLING

It shall be uniawlul for any person or the owner of 5 property 1o allow any excavation, dumping,
grading, filling or change in the confour of any properly without securing a permit from the city. The fea
for such permit shall be $25 unless the work is done in conjunction with a building permit issued for the
property, in which case there shall be no permil foe,

All grades shall be established by the: Building Commissioner, No grading will be allowed which
tauses flooding or drainage onto adjacent properties or impedes the natural flow of water, If the Building
Commissioner determines that such prohibited acts will ocour, the owner will he redquired 1o install the
necessary intemal drainage structures or other construction o protect others.

24.11 FOUNDATIONS

It shail be untawful for any persan to use a wood foundation in any construction.

2412 GARAGES

All altached garages in residential Zoning districls shall not exceed 900 Squara feet or more
thar 3 garage spaces. All detached garages in residential zoning districts shall not exceed 900 squars
leet in area, have more than 3 garage spaces, nor have a garage door opening exceading 8 feot in
height. The height of a detached garage shall not exceed 16 feet or the height of the main building on the
zoning kol, whichever is lesser, but the haight of the garage may be at least 12 feet in any evenl. Only
one delached garage shall be allowed for each single tamily dwelling or on any one residential zonindg kol

24-7 February 2018 Suppiement




o] gamge_sha!l be located cleser than 10 feet to any structure localed on the Iot. No garage
shall be erected within 3 feet of any side yard kol Bne, within 5 feat of any rear yard ol line, within 15 feat

of any stroet or in such @ manner that any portion of the garage extends past the frant of the principal
struclure on the Jot.

24,13 UTILITY AND STORAGE SHEDS

Na utility or storage shed shall exceed 182 square feet in area, 12 foet in height, or have @ wall
which exceeds 8 fest in height,  All sheds shall be erected on a permanent concrete of a trested wood
floor te which they shall be bolted or otherwise attached. ANl sheds must comply with the sethack
requirements set forth in Section 24.08 for garages. Only one storage or utility shed shall he alleowead for
each single family dwelling or on any one residential zoning lof, All sheds shall be located only o the rear
of the principal building on the Premisos.

24.14  GARBAGE AND REFUSE FACILITIES

All buildings, except single family dwellings, shall have a fenced in or otherwise shielded area
for all garbage and refuse contamers where the same are visible from the street or from a window of
anather building.

2415  AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEMS

(8] New Construction and Additions. All neswly constrocted struchres {including additions
to exisbing struclures other than in Residential Group R) in Assembly Group A, Business Group B,
Educational Group E, Factory Industrizl Group F, High-Hazard Group H. Institutional Group |, Mercantile
Group M, Residential Group R and storage Group S shall have an automatic sprinkler syslem installed
conforming to the following requirements:

1. Automatic sprinkler systems (excepl in Residential Group R struclures) shall be
designed and installed in accordance with NFEA 13 (Instailation of Sprinkler Systems), 2013
Edition, and Section 303.3 of the International Fire Code, 2012 Edition.

2. Automalic sprinkler systems for single family residences, 2-family residences and
attached townhouses where no portion of a dwelling unit s located above or below any porion
of another dwelling unit shall be designed and installed in accordance with NFPA 130
(Installation of Sprinkler Systemsz in One- and Two-Family Dwellings and Manufactured
Homes), 2012 Edition, provided further that sprinklers shall net be required in bathroomz,
clothes closets, linen closets and pantries (regardless of size) where the walls and celmgs are
surfaced with noncombustible or limited-combusiible matenals as defined in NFPA 220
{Standard on Types of Building Construction), 2012 Edition.

3. Automalic sprinkler systems for Residential Group R {excluding single Tarmily
residences, 2-family residences and attached fownhouses whers no portion of a dwelling unit is
located above or below any portion of another dwelling unit} shall be designed and installed in
accordance with NFPA 13R (Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Residenlial
Occupancies up 1o and Including Four Stories in Height), 2010 Edition, provided further that
sprinklers shall not be required in bathrooms, clothes closets, men closets and pantries
(regardless of size) where the walls and cedings are surfaced with noncombustible or limited-
combustible materials as defined in NFEA 220 (Standard on Types of Building Construction),
2012 Edition.

4.  Automatic sprinkler systems shall be installed in accordance with manufscturess
recommendations and must be connected o the City water supply system throwgh an approved
backflow prevention device.

24-8 February 2018 Supplemant




